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Equity Weekly 

Global Equities 

Global equities closed lower last week as concerns over inflation re-surfaced amid rising 

bond yields. This combined with stretched investor positioning and exhaustion likely 

exaggerated the decline. However, positive fundamentals remain in place with earnings 

season looking relatively robust. The MSCI World index dropped -3.4% 5d with volatility 

rising across the board. The VIX index, the V2X index and the INVIXN index jumped 

+56.2% 5d, +40.7% 5d and +22.3% 5d respectively. 

 

The after-effect of moves last week is likely to remain an overhang on equity markets 

this week. It is likely that investors would remain cautious and pay greater attention to 

economic data to firm up views on inflation trajectory. Regionally, with earnings season 

winding down, global cues could weigh on investor sentiment. 

 

Chart of the week 

The sell-off in equities over the last week brought into focus the stretched investor 

positioning across asset classes. For example, the mutual fund exposure to US equities 

is at its highest level since 2007 while exposure to oil is at about 2.8 standard deviation 

above average. This signals that all investors are chasing the same trade. This at a time 

when cross-asset correlation is at elevated levels, the chances of losses in one asset 

class spreading onto other remains high. The move in equities last week is perhaps a 

reflection of the same. 

Chart of the week – Stretched positioning relative to 
history 

 

Source: CFTC, Bloomberg 

 

MENA Markets 

Over the last week, the flow in regional equities was dominated by Saudi Arabian 

equities. Most other markets closed lower amid lack of positive triggers. The earnings 

season continues to remain mixed with misses from market heavyweights. The MSCI 

Arabian Markets index ended the week flat. 
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The Tadawul closed above the 7,600 level for the first time since October 2015 with 

gains of +1.8% 5d. The rally was driven by inflows from foreign and regional investors 

amidst confidence that the anti-corruption drive was moving to an end. In this broad 

rally, Al Rajhi Bank has stood out as the stock added +6.4% 5d to take its year to date 

gains to 16.5%. This is compared to +12.0% ytd rally in the Tadawul Banking index. 

The stock has also accounted for nearly 50% of total foreign inflow into Saudi Arabian 

equities so far in 2018. Among other stocks, MedGulf dropped -11.7% 5d after the 

regulator banned it from issuing or renewing policies and ordered the company to 

raise capital.  

 

UAE bourses closed lower with the DFM index losing -1.6% 5d and the ADX index 

dropping -0.7% 5d. The action was dominated by banks following corporate news 

flow. Dubai Islamic Bank lost -4.5% after the bank announced a rights issue. The 

bank aims to raise AED 1.65bn in capital by offering 1 share for every 3 held. The 

price will be announced following the shareholder’s meeting at the end of this month. 

It must be remembered that the previous rights issue in 2017 was priced at a 50% 

discount to the share price. Emirates NBD added +3.3% 5d after the bank confirmed 

that it is in preliminary talks with Sberbank to buy a stake in Turkey’s DenizBank. 

 

Developed Markets 

Developed market equities closed lower across the board amid relentless rise in bond 

yields and growing concern over inflation picking up pace. The concern over inflation 

stemmed from +2.9% y/y increase in US average hourly earnings. This was the 

fastest growth in wages since June 2009. The sell-off last week should also be seen 

in light of sharp gains across indices since the start of the year and could simply be a 

case of investor exhaustion amid moves in other asset classes. For example, the 

S&P 500 index had its best start to the year since 1997 with gains of +5.6% in 

January 2018. 

 

Eventually, the S&P 500 index, the Euro Stoxx 600 index and the Nikkei index 

dropped -3.9% 5d, -3.1% 5d and -1.5% 5d respectively. The Euro Stoxx 600 index is 

now in the negative territory for the year.  

 

Notwithstanding the sell-off in stocks, the earnings season in the US remains on a 

strong footing. Nearly 50% of companies in the S&P 500 index have reported 

earnings. According to FactSet, 75% of those companies have reported positive 

earnings surprise and 80% of those companies have reported positive sales surprise. 

The aggregate earnings growth for Q4 2017 for the S&P 500 index is 13.4%, higher 

than 11.0% anticipated growth by analysts at the end of Q4 2017. 

 

Emerging Markets 

Emerging market equities performed in line with broader markets. The MSCI EM 

index dropped -3.3% 5d to trim its year to date losses to +6.3%.  

 

India’s Nifty index dropped -2.8% 5d with all of these losses coming since the 

government announced the budget for FY 2018-2019. Overall, the budget was based 

on a predictable line with the government preparing itself for elections over the next 

12 months with greater focus on famers and low-income groups. Positively, it has 

broadly maintained the fiscal discipline displayed over the last four years. From an 

equity market perspective, the introduction of long-term capital gains tax did unnerve 

some investors even though it was on expected lines.    
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Market Data 

MENA Equity Indices 

Index Last Price wtd % chg 

T.Value 5d 

avg (USDmn) 

(USD mn) 

BEst P/E BEst P/B Div Yield 

% above 200d 

MA 

DFM 3,412 -1.6% 85.7 8.7 1.1 5.2 36.11 

ADX 4,612 -0.7% 33.7 11.2 1.4 4.4 47.46 

Tadawul 7,656 1.8% 1,229.2 13.9 1.6 3.2 58.96 

ISE 100 118,119 -1.4% 1,826.6 8.5 1.3 2.6 74.75 

EGX 30 15,089 -0.5% 42.0 10.1 1.8 2.5 73.33 

KWSE 6,685 0.5% 51.9 - - 5.2 40.91 

Bahrain 1,358 1.2% 3.3 - - 5.8 - 

MSM 5,035 0.5% 8.4 9.7 1.0 5.1 60.00 

Qatar Exchange 9,207 -2.7% 44.7 12.1 1.4 4.3 65.00 

MADEX 10,824 2.2% 25.3 18.8 2.8 3.6 80.00 

TUSISE 6,516 1.1% 1.9 20.2 - 2.1 63.64 

Developed Market Indices 

Dow Jones 25,521 -4.1% 10,983.9 17.3 3.9 2.2 90.00 

S&P 500 2,762 -3.9% 54,322.4 17.8 3.1 1.9 76.20 

Nasdaq 7,241 -3.5% 36,100.5 22.1 4.1 1.1 59.20 

FTSE 100 7,443 -2.9% 6,811.6 14.3 1.9 4.2 57.43 

Dax 12,785 -4.2% 5,929.2 13.2 1.7 3.1 55.17 

Cac 40 5,365 -3.0% 4,648.9 14.9 1.6 3.3 67.50 

Swiss 9,221 -3.1% 3,676.1 16.3 2.4 3.5 80.00 

Nikkei 23,275 -1.5% 16,584.7 19.0 1.9 1.7 82.22 

Australia 6,121 1.2% 3,623.0 16.4 2.0 4.3 73.37 

Stoxx 600 388 -3.1% 38,182.9 15.0 1.8 3.5 65.21 

Emerging Market Indices 

Hong Kong 32,602 -1.7% 7,901.6 12.7 1.4 3.1 88.00 

Shanghai 3,462 -2.7% 40,425.9 13.5 1.6 1.8 19.88 

Korea 2,525 -1.9% 7,817.9 9.4 1.0 1.4 57.24 

Sensex 35,067 -2.7% 164.3 22.5 3.0 1.1 70.97 

Nifty 10,761 -2.8% 2,445.1 21.4 3.0 1.3 62.00 

Karachi 44,301 -0.6% 58.9 9.6 1.5 5.3 44.57 

Taiwan 11,126 -0.2% 3,987.9 14.3 1.9 3.6 65.56 

Bovespa 84,041 -1.7% 2,946.0 13.5 1.7 2.3 83.87 

Micex 2,282 -0.6% 826.8 6.7 0.8 4.8 77.78 

Jo'burg 58,657 -4.8% 2,557.5 16.2 2.0 2.8 60.25 

Vietnam 1,105 -1.0% 307.5 19.6 3.5 1.9 55.48 

Jakarta 6,629 -0.5% 632.6 17.0 2.7 1.8 54.61 

Source: Bloomberg, BEst – Bloomberg Estimate     
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Relative Valuations 

Benchmark Equity Indices 

Index Last Price wtd % chg 1m % chg Ytd % chg BEst P/E BEst P/B Div Yield 

MSCI World 2,172 -3.4% 0.7% 3.2% 16.67 2.34 2.29 

MSCI G7 1,963 -3.6% 0.6% 3.2% 16.78 2.43 2.13 

MSCI EM 1,231 -3.3% 2.5% 6.2% 13.14 1.68 2.20 

MSCI FM 665 -2.2% 2.0% 4.3% 13.31 2.01 2.95 

S&P Pan Arab 724 0.4% - - 8.27 1.51 3.67 

DUAE INDEX 3,436 -1.4% 2.2% 3.5% 10.26 1.31 4.89 

DKUW INDEX 3,545 -2.7% 3.8% 3.9% - - - 

DQAT INDEX 5,649 -3.3% 6.0% 6.3% 11.43 1.54 3.39 

DKUS INDEX 2,891 -2.5% 3.3% 3.2% 14.85 1.79 2.38 

DQAS INDEX 7,618 -3.1% 5.4% 6.9% 13.30 1.65 4.77 

Relative to S&P Pan Arab Composite Index 

Index PE PB Dvd Yield Index PE PB Dvd Yield 

DFM 5.1% -23.9% 41.1% Bahrain - - 57.8% 

ADX 35.0% -6.4% 19.5% MSM 17.4% -35.3% 40.1% 

Tadawul 68.3% 4.5% -12.9% Qatar 

Exchange 

46.7% -10.4% 17.5% 

KWSE - - 42.1% TUSISE 144.0% - -41.8% 

Relative to MSCI G7 Index 

Dow Jones 3.2% 59.8% 3.3% Cac 40 -11.4% -36.0% 53.1% 

S&P 500 5.9% 29.4% -9.8% Swiss -2.6% -1.7% 62.5% 

Nasdaq 31.5% 71.0% -50.2% Nikkei 13.1% -22.1% -20.2% 

FTSE 100 -14.8% -20.8% 97.2% Australia -2.0% -16.8% 100.5% 

Dax -21.2% -31.5% 47.5% Stoxx 600 -10.7% -24.5% 65.3% 

Relative to MSCI Emerging Market Index 

Hong Kong -3.3% -17.9% 42.7% Jo'burg 23.3% 19.4% 27.0% 

Shanghai 3.0% -5.7% -18.8% Vietnam 49.3% 109.8% -12.3% 

Korea -28.3% -38.5% -38.7% Jakarta 29.4% 57.8% -16.8% 

Sensex 71.0% 79.9% -49.3%     

Nifty 63.0% 78.7% -42.8%     

Karachi -26.6% -8.3% 140.7%     

Taiwan 8.8% 10.6% 64.5%     

Bovespa 3.0% 2.1% 6.5%     

Micex -49.1% -54.7% 117.7%     

Source: Bloomberg, BEst – Bloomberg Estimate     
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Disclaimer 

PLEASE READ THE FOLLOWING TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF ACCESS FOR THE PUBLICATION BEFORE THE USE THEREOF. By continuing to access and use the 
publication, you signify you accept these terms and conditions. Emirates NBD reserves the right to amend, remove, or add to the publication and Disclaimer at any time. Such 
modifications shall be effective immediately. Accordingly, please continue to review this Disclaimer whenever accessing, or using the publication. Your access of, and use of the 
publication, after modifications to the Disclaimer will constitute your acceptance of the terms and conditions of use of the publication, as modified. If, at any time, you do not wish 
to accept the content of this Disclaimer, you may not access, or use the publication. Any terms and conditions proposed by you which are in addition to or which conflict with this 
Disclaimer are expressly rejected by Emirates NBD and shall be of no force or effect. Information contained herein is believed by Emirates NBD to be accurate and true but 
Emirates NBD expresses no representation or warranty of such accuracy and accepts no responsibility whatsoever for any loss or damage caused by any act or omission taken 
as a result of the information contained in the publication. The publication is provided for informational uses only and is not intended for trading purposes. Charts, graphs and 
related data/information provided herein are intended to serve for illustrative purposes. The data/information contained in the publication is not designed to initiate or conclude any 
transaction. In addition, the data/information contained in the publication is prepared as of a particular date and time and will not reflect subsequent changes in the market or 
changes in any other factors relevant to their determination. The publication may include data/information taken from stock exchanges and other sources from around the world 
and Emirates NBD does not guarantee the sequence, accuracy, completeness, or timeliness of information contained in the publication provided thereto by or obtained from 
unaffiliated third parties. Moreover, the provision of certain data/information in the publication may be subject to the terms and conditions of other agreements to which Emirates 
NBD is a party.  
 
None of the content in the publication constitutes a solicitation, offer or recommendation by Emirates NBD to buy or sell any security, or represents the provision by Emirates NBD 
of investment advice or services regarding the profitability or suitability of any security or investment. Moreover, the content of the publication should not be considered legal, tax, 
accounting advice. The publication is not intended for use by, or distribution to, any person or entity in any jurisdiction or country where such use or distribution would be contrary 
to law or regulation. Accordingly, anything to the contrary herein set forth notwithstanding, Emirates NBD, its suppliers, agents, directors, officers, employees, representatives, 
successors, assigns, affiliates or subsidiaries shall not, directly or indirectly, be liable, in any way, to you or any other person for any: (a) inaccuracies or errors in or omissions 
from the publication including, but not limited to, quotes and financial data; (b) loss or damage arising from the use of the publication, including, but not limited to any investment 
decision occasioned thereby. (c) UNDER NO CIRCUMSTANCES, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO NEGLIGENCE, SHALL EMIRATES NBD, ITS SUPPLIERS, AGENTS, 
DIRECTORS, OFFICERS, EMPLOYEES, REPRESENTATIVES, SUCCESSORS, ASSIGNS, AFFILIATES OR SUBSIDIARIES BE LIABLE TO YOU FOR DIRECT, INDIRECT, 
INCIDENTAL, CONSEQUENTIAL, SPECIAL, PUNITIVE, OR EXEMPLARY DAMAGES EVEN IF EMIRATES NBD HAS BEEN ADVISED SPECIFICALLY OF THE POSSIBILITY 
OF SUCH DAMAGES, ARISING FROM THE USE OF THE PUBLICATION, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO, LOSS OF REVENUE, OPPORTUNITY, OR ANTICIPATED 
PROFITS OR LOST BUSINESS. The information contained in the publication does not purport to contain all matters relevant to any particular investment or financial instrument 
and all statements as to future matters are not guaranteed to be accurate. Anyone proposing to rely on or use the information contained in the publication should independently 
verify and check the accuracy, completeness, reliability and suitability of the information and should obtain independent and specific advice from appropriate professionals or 
experts regarding information contained in the publication. Further, references to any financial instrument or investment product is not intended to imply that an actual trading 
market exists for such instrument or product. In publishing this document Emirates NBD is not acting in the capacity of a fiduciary or financial advisor.  
 
Emirates NBD and its group entities (together and separately, "Emirates NBD") does and may at any time solicit or provide commercial banking, investment banking, credit, 
advisory or other services to the companies covered in its reports. As a result, recipients of this report should be aware that any or all of the foregoing services may at times give 
rise to a conflict of interest that could affect the objectivity of this report.  
 
The securities covered by this report may not be suitable for all types of investors. The report does not take into account the investment objectives, financial situations and specific 
needs of recipients.  
 
Data included in the publication may rely on models that do not reflect or take into account all potentially significant factors such as market risk, liquidity risk and credit risk. 
Emirates NBD may use different models, make valuation adjustments, or use different methodologies when determining prices at which Emirates NBD is willing to trade financial 
instruments and/or when valuing its own inventory positions for its books and records. In receiving the publication, you acknowledge and agree that there are risks associated with 
investment activities. Moreover, you acknowledge in receiving the publication that the responsibility to obtain and carefully read and understand the content of documents relating 
to any investment activity described in the publication and to seek separate, independent financial advice if required to assess whether a particular investment activity described 
herein is suitable, lies exclusively with you. You acknowledge and agree that past investment performance is not indicative of the future performance results of any investment and 
that the information contained herein is not to be used as an indication for the future performance of any investment activity. You acknowledge that the publication has been 
developed, compiled, prepared, revised, selected, and arranged by Emirates NBD and others (including certain other information sources) through the application of methods and 
standards of judgment developed and applied through the expenditure of substantial time, effort, and money and constitutes valuable intellectual property of Emirates NBD and 
such others. All present and future rights in and to trade secrets, patents, copyrights, trademarks, service marks, know-how, and other proprietary rights of any type under the 
laws of any governmental authority, domestic or foreign, shall, as between you and Emirates NBD, at all times be and remain the sole and exclusive property of Emirates NBD 
and/or other lawful parties. Except as specifically permitted in writing, you acknowledge and agree that you may not copy or make any use of the content of the publication or any 
portion thereof. Except as specifically permitted in writing, you shall not use the intellectual property rights connected with the publication, or the names of any individual 
participant in, or contributor to, the content of the publication, or any variations or derivatives thereof, for any purpose.  
 
YOU AGREE TO USE THE PUBLICATION SOLELY FOR YOUR OWN NONCOMMERCIAL USE AND BENEFIT, AND NOT FOR RESALE OR OTHER TRANSFER OR 
DISPOSITION TO, OR USE BY OR FOR THE BENEFIT OF, ANY OTHER PERSON OR ENTITY. YOU AGREE NOT TO USE, TRANSFER, DISTRIBUTE, OR DISPOSE OF 
ANY DATA/INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THE PUBLICATION IN ANY MANNER THAT COULD COMPETE WITH THE BUSINESS INTERESTS OF EMIRATES NBD. YOU 
MAY NOT COPY, REPRODUCE, PUBLISH, DISPLAY, MODIFY, OR CREATE DERIVATIVE WORKS FROM ANY DATA/INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THE PUBLICATION. 
YOU MAY NOT OFFER ANY PART OF THE PUBLICATION FOR SALE OR DISTRIBUTE IT OVER ANY MEDIUM WITHOUT THE PRIOR WRITTEN CONSENT OF EMIRATES 
NBD. THE DATA/INFORMATION CONTAINED IN THE PUBLICATION MAY NOT BE USED TO CONSTRUCT A DATABASE OF ANY KIND. YOU MAY NOT USE THE 
DATA/INFORMATION IN THE PUBLICATION IN ANY WAY TO IMPROVE THE QUALITY OF ANY DATA SOLD OR CONTRIBUTED TO BY YOU TO ANY THIRD PARTY. 
FURTHERMORE, YOU MAY NOT USE ANY OF THE TRADEMARKS, TRADE NAMES, SERVICE MARKS, COPYRIGHTS, OR LOGOS OF EMIRATES NBD OR ITS 
SUBSIDIARIES IN ANY MANNER WHICH CREATES THE IMPRESSION THAT SUCH ITEMS BELONG TO OR ARE ASSOCIATED WITH YOU OR, EXCEPT AS OTHERW ISE 
PROVIDED WITH EMIRATES NBD’S PRIOR WRITTEN CONSENT, AND YOU ACKNOWLEDGE THAT YOU HAVE NO OWNERSHIP RIGHTS IN AND TO ANY OF SUCH 
ITEMS. MOREOVER YOU AGREE THAT YOUR USE OF THE PUBLICATION IS AT YOUR SOLE RISK AND ACKNOWLEDGE THAT THE PUBLICATION AND ANYTHING 
CONTAINED HEREIN, IS PROVIDED "AS IS" AND "AS AVAILABLE," AND THAT EMIRATES NBD MAKES NO WARRANTY OF ANY KIND, EXPRESS OR IMPLIED, AS TO 
THE PUBLICATION, INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED TO, MERCHANTABILITY, NON-INFRINGEMENT, TITLE, OR FITNESS FOR A PARTICULAR PURPOSE OR USE. You 
agree, at your own expense, to indemnify, defend and hold harmless Emirates NBD, its Suppliers, agents, directors, officers, employees, representatives, successors, and 
assigns from and against any and all claims, damages, liabilities, costs, and expenses, including reasonable attorneys’ and experts’ fees, arising out of or in connection with the 
publication, including, but not limited to: (i) your use of the data contained in the publication or someone using such data on your behalf; (ii) any deletions, additions, insertions or 
alterations to, or any unauthorized use of, the data contained in the publication or (iii) any misrepresentation or breach of an acknowledgement or agreement made as a result of 
your receiving the publication.  
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